
 

FOR IMMEDIATE RELEASE: December 19, 2023 
 
Cinéfest Sudbury announces award-winning film starring Jessica 
Chastain and Peter Sarsgaard as first Red Carpet film of 2024 
 
SUDBURY — Cinéfest Sudbury is set to bring Memory to the big 
screen as part of its 2024 Red Carpet Patron Program. The 
critically acclaimed emotional drama is set to screen at SilverCity 
Sudbury on Wednesday, January 24 at 7:00 p.m. 
 
Sylvia (Academy Award winner Jessica Chastain, The Eyes of 
Tammy Faye) is a social worker who leads a simple and structured 
life: her daughter, her job, her AA meetings. This is blown open 
when Saul (Peter Sarsgaard) follows her home from their high 
school reunion. Their surprise encounter will profoundly impact 
both of them as they open the door to the past. Memory screened 
at the Venice Film Festival earlier this fall where Peter Sarsgaard 
was awarded Best Actor. Jessica Chastain was also recently 
nominated for Best Lead Performance at the 2024 Film 
Independent Spirit Awards. 
 
Individual tickets are on sale now with limited availability at 
www.cinefest.com, at the Cinéfest Box Office (located at 40 Larch 
Street, Unit 103), or by calling 705-688-1234. All Red Carpet 
Patrons are granted complimentary admittance. 
 
Cinéfest’s Red Carpet Patron Program offers access to 6 yearly 
film screenings, exclusive perks at Cinéfest Sudbury International 
Film Festival, and more! 2024 Red Carpet Patron Program passes 
are available now at www.cinefest.com/rcpp. 
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For more information related to Cinéfest Sudbury’s Red Carpet 
Patron Program, please email redcarpet@cinefest.com or call 
705-688-1234. 
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